
WINE LIST



We are proud to work with Scotland’s own 
WoodWinters, importer, wholesaler, retailer and  

11 time winner of IWC Merchant of the Year



WINES

SPARKLING    125 bottle

1 MIRABELLO PROSECCO    £7.50 £32.00
 ITALY, VENEZIE

Fresh and gently fruity fizz with citrus and green apple aromas. Delicate and lively on the 
palate with ripe, lightly grapey fruit, zesty acidity and a clean, refreshing finish.

2 DOMAINE DU LANDREAU CRÉMANT DE LOIRE BRUT    £10.50 £44.00
 FRANCE, LOIRE

This traditional method blend of Chenin Blanc and Cabernet Franc is clean, crisp and 
expressive with delicate floral, citrus and apple notes and nutty undertones.

3 GUSBOURNE RESERVE BRUT     £12.00 £60.00
 ENGLAND, SUSSEX

Fresh pastry notes with cinnamon and spice lead to a bright streak of citrus fruit, giving 
tones of soft stone fruit and a long, refreshing finish.

4 GUSBOURNE ROSÉ      £65.00
 ENGLAND, SUSSEX

Delicate, pale and light pink. The nose brims with soft summer berries, soft red fruits, 
cranberries and ripe cherries on the palate.

CHAMPAGNE   125 bottle

5 TAITTINGER BRUT    £16.00 £85.00
 FRANCE, CHAMPAGNE

Very expressive and delicate with flavours of fresh green fruit, honey and a sutle twist of 
citrus and brioche.

6 PIAFF BRUT     £69.00
 FRANCE, CHAMPAGNE

Elegant yet lively with initial brioche on the nose leading to pear and apple notes, 
highlighted by a magnificent persistent mousse.

7 TAITTINGER PRESTIGE ROSÉ     £90.00
 FRANCE, CHAMPAGNE

A superb rose from the renowned house of Taittinger. Very much in the delicate and elegant 
house style, but with the extra weight of fresh red berry fruits from the extra Pinot Noir.

ROSÉ  175 250 500 bottle

30 FALSE BAY ROSÉ   £7.50 £11.75 £21.00 £31.00
 SOUTH AFRICA, WESTERN CAPE

A delicately spiced and deliciously fruity, dry rosé from Cinsault and Mourvedre grapes.

31 ‘LES CERISIERS’ CÔTES DU RHÔNE ROSÉ   £10.50 £15.50 £29.00 £42.00
 FRANCE, RHÔNE

Delicate red fruit flavours combined with hints of white pepper and a waft of the aromatic 
herbal perfumes of the Southern Rhône.

32 GUSBOURNE ESTATE ROSÉ     £60.00
 ENGLAND, KENT

Aromas of ripe strawberries and apricots with biscuit and oatmeal. The palate demonstrates 
a vibrant acidity highlighting bright raspberry, red currant and crunchy red apple.

SWEET / FORTIFIED  75 125 bottle

33 ÁTS LATE HARVEST TOKAJ (50CL)   £11.00 £16.50 £66.00
 HUNGARY, TOKAJ

The personal project Of Karoly Áts, one of the finest producers of Tokaj in Hungary, this is 
a lighter, fresher style elegant citrus sweetness, retaining notes of succulent Mediterranean 
fruits.

34 FERNANDO DE CASTILLA CLASSIC FINO   £5.20 £8.50
 SPAIN, JEREZ

Crisp, tangy sherry. Pale straw yellow in appearance, the nose displays camomile tea, lemon, 
almonds and sea spray. The palate is crisp, clean and fresh with zingy acidity and light fruit.

35 QUINTA DE LA ROSA LBV    £7.50
 PORTUGAL, DOURO

Deep ruby colour with upfront aromas of black plums, spice and dried herbs, firm and 
evident tannins and a rich, long finish. Generous and pure.

36 QUINTA DE LA ROSA WHITE PORT    £8.25
 PORTUGAL, DOURO

It shows excellent fruit on the palate, tropical fruits especially pineapple, but at the same 
time has a long dry finish, typical of the house style.

All wines by the glass available in 125ml measures on request



WHITE 175 250 500 bottle

8 AQUILINE SAUVIGNON BLANC    £7.50 £11.75 £21.00 £31.00
 SOUTH AFRICA, WESTERN CAPE

Green apple and ripe citrus characters on the palate with cleansing acidity and a nice streak 
of minerality on the finish.

9 GPG GARGANEGA PINOT GRIGIO  £7.50 £11.75 £21.00 £34.00
 ITALY, VENETO

This blend uses the richer fruited Garganega (Soave) and blends it with Pinot Grigio, 
creating an easy drinking style with ripe citrus aromas and red apple flavours.

10 FALSE BAY CHENIN BLANC  £8.30 £13.00 £23.00 £32.00
 SOUTH AFRICA, WESTERN CAPE

Gentle ripe apple aromas, honeyed aromatics and delicious greengage and citrus lemon on 
the long finish. Made in a lusciously rich and dry style.

11 LISTENING STATION CHARDONNAY  £8.50 £13.25 £24.00 £35.00
 AUSTRALIA, VICTORIA

Refreshingly unoaked, citrus and white peach flavours combine with a zesty fresh acidity 
and a clean, bright and linear mineral finish.

12 DOMAINE DE CASTELNAU PICPOUL DE PINET  £9.50 £13.75 £25.50 £38.00
 FRANCE, LANGUEDOC

The variety’s ability to keep acidity in a hot, Mediterranean climate makes it the perfect 
choice for the region, making it taut and full-bodied with herbal and citrus aromas.

13 ESK VALLEY SAUVIGNON BLANC  £11.50 £16.00 £30.00 £46.00
 NEW ZEALAND, MARLBOROUGH

Exactly as it should be! This fruity, full-on wine is full of passion fruit, stone fruits and citrus 
with a touch of herbaceousness and a lovely long finish.

14 CAMINO REAL RIOJA BLANCO     £37.00
 SPAIN, RIOJA

Ripe fruit, dates and banana notes stand out on the nose in combination with the nuances 
of the oak, making it a complex, fresh and fleshy wine.

15 CASTELLO DI TASSAROLO GAVI ‘SPINOLA’     £54.00
 ITALY, PIEMONTE

100% Cortese from vineyards around Alborina lake, the concentrated core of the wine 
shows fantastic breadth of lime, orange blossom, flowers and greengage. 

16 DOMAINE FOURNILLON CHABLIS     £60.00
 FRANCE, CHABLIS

This small family-owned domaine produce wines are splendidly typical of the region - crisp 
and mineral with a generous palate, making them a wonderful, restrained partner for food.

17 DOMAINE BOTT-GEYL RIESLING LES ELEMENTS       £64.00
 FRANCE, ALSACE

Clear, ripe and concentrated stone fruit udepinned with a complex minerality leading to a 
nicely clear and dry finish.

18 DOMAINE CHRISTIAN BELLANG MEURSAULT                 £110.00
 FRANCE, BURGUNDY

Full of classic butter and expressive creamy fruit flavours with a clean citrus backbone from 
a family owned estate dating back to 1789. 

RED 175 250 500 bottle

19 STAPHYLE IRIS MALBEC  £8.00 £12.00 £22.00 £32.00 
 ARGENTINA, MENDOZA

Young, fresh and fruity Malbec from Mendoza with flavours of plums and freshly picked 
cherries. Soft, round, and enveloping! 

20 DA VERO ORGANIC NERO D’AVOLA   £8.00 £12.00 £22.00 £32.00
 ITALY, SICILY

Simple in the nicest possible way! Charming raspberry coulis character and organic to boot! 
Fresh and balanced with red fruit and black cherry notes. 

21 TIERRA ALTA MERLOT  £8.00 £12.00 £22.00 £32.00
 CHILE, CENTRAL VALLEY

Very dark and juicy Merlot showing plenty of cool climate fruit aromas. The palate is rich 
with herbaceous notes and a lot of fresh plum flavours.

22 DOMAINE DE CASTELNAU L’EPICERIE   £8.50 £13.00 £24.00 £35.00
 FRANCE, LANGUEDOC

A high-end bistro-style wine with a lively blood orange and mint palate leading to intense 
and velvety tannins.

23 CAMINO REAL CRIANZA RIOJA  £9.50 £13.75 £26.00 £38.00
 SPAIN, RIOJA

Aromas of ripe fruit and complex spicy, balsamic notes, this is a round and unctuous wine 
with ripe and sweet tannins. Elegant and classic.

24 AGRICOLE VALLONE APPASSIMENTO  £11.80 £15.50 £31.50 £46.00
 ITALY, PUGLIA

The Negroamaro grapes are late-harvested to allow drying on the vines, leading to intense 
dark chocolate with a lace of spicy aromatics and bitter-sweet fruits.

25 DOMAINE CHANTE CIGALE CICADA     £45.00
 FRANCE, RHÔNE

From a top Châteauneuf producer, this has fresh raspberry fruits on the nose, flavours being 
more ripe cherry with a touch of spice. The Carignan adds soul to the vibrant Grenache.

26 CHÂTEAU JAMARD BELCOUR LUSSAC-SAINT-ÉMILION     £50.00
 FRANCE, BORDEAUX

90% Merlot with a dash of Cabernet Franc, this leads with aromas of damson, summer 
berries and a hint of spice, opening up to reveal prune and mocha notes.

27 ADOBE ORGANIC PINOT NOIR      £45.00
 CHILE, CASABLANCA VALLEY

Aromas of fresh strawberries accompanied by subtle notes of spice. The medium bodied 
palate is elegant, delicate and fresh with ripe tannins and a long finish.

28 ANTHONIJ RUPERT OPTIMA     £70.00
 SOUTH AFRICA, WESTERN CAPE

This sports a big and fleshy profile whilst maintaining a tight structure with firm tannins. A 
revved-up, deliciously juicy experience that overdelivers on evry level.

29 DOMAINE CHANTE CIGALE CHÂTEAUNEUF-DU-PAPE                              £105.00
 FRANCE, RHÔNE

A traditional Châteauneuf-du-Pape with a peppery, leathery nose. The palate is richly dark-
fruited and dry with spices, more pepper and a hint of vanilla before a delicious, firm finish.


